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 Collaborate with federal, state, and local governments to clarify the role of environmental 
health personnel in the staffing of emergency operation centers, serving as members of 
specialized environmental health strike teams, or participating on emergency 
preparedness and response task forces. 

 
Analysis 

Environmental health plays an essential role in disaster preparedness, response, recovery, and 
mitigation. Depending on where a disaster occurs and on the types of environmental health 
hazards present, the environmental health workforce may be responsible for ensuring the health 
and safety of the public, surveillance of adequate hygiene and sanitation systems, food and water 
safety, waste management, temporary shelter operations, infectious disease control, and 
vectorborne disease control, among other functions. In addition to these core functions, 
environmental health professionals are often called on to support other response and recovery 
activities, including but not limited to contract tracing, crowd dispersal, standing up mass 
vaccination sites, business recovery, and logistics support. These expanded roles have never been 
clearer than they are in the wake of the COVID-19 pandemic. According to a workforce needs 
assessment conducted by NEHA (2020), over 80% of the surveyed environmental health 
workforce indicated that they were tasked with an expanded scope of work outside their regular 
duties. 
 
A collection of agencies, programs, laws, and certifications exist that provides guidance and 
informs how the role of environmental health in emergency preparedness and response is 
understood and funded. The Centers for Disease Control and Prevention’s (CDC) Public Health 
Emergency Preparedness (PHEP) program was developed after 9/11 to help state, local, tribal, 
and territorial governments successfully prepare for and respond to emergencies and disasters 
(CDC, 2021). Since its implementation, PHEP has improved the percentage of jurisdictions that 
can mobilize public health staff during an emergency from 20% before 2002 to 98% in 2018 
(CDC, 2021). CDC created the Public Health Preparedness Capabilities: National Standards for 
State and Local Planning in 2011 (CDC, 2019). The PHEP capabilities guidance was updated in 
2018 with an expanded role for environmental health in public health emergency preparedness 
(CDC, 2019). This iteration of the PHEP guidance also details emergency shelter health and 
safety criteria composed largely of traditional environmental health capabilities such as verifying 
water quality and food safety, surveillance of sanitation, vector control, and waste management 
(CDC, 2019). The numerous environmental health responsibilities detailed in the PHEP 
capabilities make the involvement of environmental health personnel in preparedness planning 
essential. In many states and localities, however, the PHEP funding necessary to properly train 
environmental health personnel to fulfill that role is not reaching the environmental health 
community. 
 
The first Pandemic and All-Hazards Preparedness Act (PAHPA) was signed into law in 2006 and 
established the Assistant Secretary for Preparedness and Response (ASPR) within the U.S. 
Department of Health and Human Services, advanced medical response counter measures 



 

 
 

NEHA Policy Statement on the Role of Environmental Health in Preparedness 3 
 
 

development, and advocated the development of the National Health Security Strategy (Office of 
the Assistant Secretary for Preparedness and Response, 2019). The goal of PAHPA is to provide 
the U.S. with enhanced abilities related to all-hazard emergency and disaster preparedness and 
response with ASPR to lead the collaborative efforts necessary to achieve this goal (Office of the 
Assistant Secretary for Preparedness and Response, 2019). The Pandemic and All-Hazards 
Preparedness and Advancing Innovation Act of 2019 (PAHPAIA), for the first time, explicitly 
mentions including environmental health agencies as public health agencies that have specific 
expertise potentially relevant to public health security. 
 
Justification 

The importance of the role of the environmental health workforce has been recognized in the 
most recent iterations of key preparedness documents, including PHEP capabilities and the 2019 
PAHPAIA. These documents provide the foundation for integrating environmental health 
personnel into all aspects of emergency preparedness and response training. Previous iterations 
of these documents failed to call out environmental health and references to environmental 
health in the new iterations are spread throughout the documents, rather than encapsulated in a 
separate capability for environmental health preparedness (Dyjack, 2017). 
 

The National Qualification System (NQS) supplements the resource management component of 
the National Incident Management System and establishes guidance and tools to assist 
stakeholders in developing processes for qualifying, certifying, and credentialing deployable 
emergency personnel. (Federal Emergency Management Agency, 2021) The essential role of 
environment 
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this critical training for first responders they must first be involved in all aspects of emergency 

https://doi.org/10.1289/EHP5161
https://www.cdc.gov/cpr/readiness/00_docs/CDC_PreparednesResponseCapabilities_October2018_Final_508.pdf
https://www.cdc.gov/cpr/readiness/00_docs/CDC_PreparednesResponseCapabilities_October2018_Final_508.pdf
https://www.cdc.gov/cpr/readiness/00_docs/CDC_PreparednesResponseCapabilities_October2018_Final_508.pdf
https://www.cdc.gov/cpr/whatwedo/phep.htm
/membership-communities/get-involved/blog/long-overdue-environmental-health-and-public-health
/membership-communities/get-involved/blog/long-overdue-environmental-health-and-public-health
/membership-communities/get-involved/blog/long-overdue-environmental-health-and-public-health
https://www.fema.gov/emergency-managers/nims/components
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